Crty oF BrRyaN

The Good Life, Texas Style!

City of Bryan - Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation for #14-044
North Texas Avenue Cooling Tower

5/7/2014

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not be construed as any

indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will notify the successful bidder upon award of contract.

Kilgore Industries

Garrett Mechanical

REC Industries

Bryan Construction

# of Copies (1 complete original) Y Y Y Y
Executed 5% Bidder's Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Certification from bid package (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Acknowledged Addendum #1 & 2 (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Felony Conviction Notification (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Franchise Tax Certificate of Account Status Y Y Y Y
Bidders Qualifications Y Y Y Y
ITEM [ EST. QTY | UNIT DESCRIPTION
Furnish all labor, materials, permits, tools, supplies and
equipment, and perform all work required for the
construction and operational completion of the new
Cooling Tower system as shown in the Drawings and
specified herein, except those costs specifically
1 1 Ls | included in the other Items, complete in place. $2,260,000.00 $1,086,095.00 $1,029,750.00 $807,600.00
Furnish and install the Cooling Tower, manufactured
by Marley, in accordance with Section 15651 (Field
Erected Cooling Towers) complete in place and
2 1 Ls | fully operational. $900,000.00 $775,385.00 $850,000.00 $819,200.00
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Crty oF BrRyaN

The Good Life, Texas Style.

City of Bryan - Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation for #14-

044

North Texas Avenue Cooling Tower

5/7/2014

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will notify the successful bidder upon award of contract.

Kilgore Industries

Garrett Mechanical

REC Industries

Bryan Construction

3 350

LF

Furnish all labor, equipment, materials, and tools to
provide trench safety (all depths and pipe sizes) in
accordance with all applicable City, State and Federal
laws, ordinances, rules and guidelines, (professional
engineering services for this item shall be included in
Base Bid Item No. 1), complete in place.

$54,950.00

$2,999.50

$12,250.00

$700.00

LS

Mobilization/Demobilization For mobilization and
demobilization to the sites and any project overhead
associated with mobilization/demobilization. Payment
shall be in accordance with Special Provision SP4.

$100,000.00

$40,000.00

$97,000.00

$132,000.00

LS

Furnish programming services to incorporate proposed
additional signals to the existing SCADA system. Refer to
Section 13300 (Instrumentation and Controls — General
Provisions) and to Section 13305 (Control Descriptions).

$175,000.00

$145,000.00

$160,000.00

$92,600.00

TOTAL BASE BID AMOUNT (Total of Items 1 through 5)

$3,435,000.00

$2,049,479.50

$2,149,000.00

$1,852,100.00

Vendor miscalculated base
amt - above cost is correct

Vendor miscalculated item
3 - above cost is correct
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Crty oF BrRyaN

The Good Life, Texas Style.

City of Bryan - Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation for #14-044
North Texas Avenue Cooling Tower

5/7/2014

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will notify the successful bidder upon award of contract.

Kilgore Industries

Garrett Mechanical

REC Industries

Bryan Construction

ITEM | EST QTY

UNIT DESCRIPTION

ALTERNATE BID

Furnish and install the Cooling Tower, manufactured
by an alternate, Engineer approved manufacturer, in
accordance with Section 15651(Field Erected Cooling

Towers) complete in place and fully operational.
LS

NO BID

NO BID

$860,000.00

NO BID

Provide all necessary modifications, including all civil,
structural, mechanical, electrical, and instrumentation
modifications, based on installing the Cooling Tower
manufactured by the alternate manufacturer (Alternate
Bid Item 1) for a complete in place and fully operational
Cooling Tower system. Refer Section 15651 (Field
Erected Cooling Towers).

LS

NO BID

$70,000.00

$1,299,000.00

NO BID

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT (Total of Items 1 and 2)
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