City of Bryan - Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation for #13-043
Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals

Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All'bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not

be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will E-MED Medical Co. EMS Suppl}/ & Bound Tree Medical
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract. Pharmaceuticals
Complete Bid Packet Y Y Y
Acknowledged Addendum #1 (Y/N) Y Y Y
Provided Current Catalog (Y/N) Y Y Y
Delivery Days 3-4 Days 3 2-3 Days, in stock items
Inventory Tracking System Verification N Y Yes, VW
Methodof Payment (Prompt Payment Discount) ('Y/N) No Discount No Discount .25 w/10 days
Felony Conviction Notification (Y/N) Y Y Y
Client References (Y/N) Y Y Y
Certification of Bid (Y/N) Y Y Y

EMS Supply &

E-MED Medical Co.

Pharmaceuticals

Bound Tree Medical

ITEM [Est Qty DESCRIPTION Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

CATEGORY 1: Airway NO BID

1 2 ea |ADC Laryngoscope Replacement Buld, SM $0.00 $1.10 $2.20 $1.20 $2.40

2 5 ea |ADC Laryngoscope Replacement Bulb, LG $0.00 $1.10 $5.50 $1.20 $6.00

3 10 | ea |Adjustable Peep Valve, Disposable, 30mm ID $0.00 4.38 $43.80 $3.05 $30.50
AirLife Oxygen Mask, Non-Rebreather, Under the Chin, 7

4 1700 | ea |foot Tubing, Adult $0.00 $1.16 $1,972.00 $0.68 $1,159.40
AirLife Oxygen Mask, Non-Rebreather, Under the Chin, 7

5 100 | ea [foot Tubing, Pediatric $0.00 $1.00 $100.00 $0.68 $68.00
AirLife Prefilled Humidifier Systems, with Humidifier

6 20 ea |Adapter, 500ml $0.00 $2.06 $41.20 $1.68 $33.60

7 5 ea [B.A.A.M. Airflow Monitor $0.00 $8.35 $41.75 $7.43 $37.15
Bag Assist Nebulizer Kit, includes Medic-Aid High-Speed,

8 35 | ea|side Stream Nebulizer $0.00 $3.70 $129.50 $3.02 $105.70

9 6 ea |Bite Stick, Plastic, One-Piece, Unbreakable, 10/pk $0.00 $0.21 $1.26 $0.24 $1.44
Breathing Circuit, w/MED Mask, for PortO2Vent CPAPos

10 6 ea |Oxygen Delivery System $0.00 $19.80 $118.80 $83.54 $501.24
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Breathing Circuit, w/MED Mask, for PortO2Vent CPAPos

11 5 ea |Oxygen Delivery System $0.00 $45.82 $229.10 $33.82 $169.10
CURAPLEX Nebulizers, T Piece, Mouthpiece, Flextube, 7

12 325 | ea |Foot Tubing $0.00 $0.72 $234.00 $0.69 $224.25

13 25 | ea |Cylinder Wrench, for E Cylinders, Plastic $0.00 $0.54 $13.50 $0.21 $5.25
Endotrol Hi-Lo Endotracheal Tube, w/controllable tip, 24

14 4 ea |Fr, 6.0mm $0.00 $0.94 $3.76 $9.11 $36.44
Endotrol Hi-Lo Endotracheal Tube, w/controllable tip, 26

15 8 ea |Fr. 7.0mm $0.00 $0.94 $7.52 $8.61 $68.88
ET Tube Disp Introducer, (BOUGIE) Blue Coude Tip, 15

16 20 | ea |French x 70cm, Adult SunMed $0.00 $3.98 $79.60 $3.95 $79.00

17 8 ea |Fixed Flange Mediprene Nasopharyngeal Airways, 22 French $0.00 $2.33 $18.64 $1.99 $15.92

18 15 | ea |Fixed Flange Mediprene Nasopharyngeal Airways, 26 French $0.00 $2.33 $34.95 $1.99 $29.85

19 15 ea [Fixed Flange Mediprene Nasopharyngeal Airways, 30 French $0.00 $2.33 $34.95 $1.99 $29.85

20 14 | ea |Flexi-Set Cuffed ET Tube w/Stylet, Plastic, 6mm $0.00 $1.48 $20.72 $3.85 $53.90

21 50 | ea |Flexi-Set Cuffed ET Tube w/Stylet, Plastic, 7.0mm $0.00 $1.49 $74.50 $3.85 $192.50

22 25 | ea |Flexi-Set Cuffed ET Tube w/Stylet, Plastic, 8.0mm $0.00 $1.46 $36.50 $3.85 $96.25
Stainless Steel Laryngoscope Blade, ET Maclntosh Blade

23 12 ea |#1 Reusable Flexi-Set Cuffed ET Tube w/Stylet, Plastic, $0.00 $1.48 $17.76 $3.85 $46.20

24 6 ea |Flexi-Set Uncuffed ET Tube wi/Stylet, Plastic, 3.0mm $0.00 $1.47 $8.82 $3.32 $19.92

25 3 ea |Flexi-Set Uncuffed ET Tube w/Stylet, Plastic, 4.0mm $0.00 $1.46 $4.38 $3.32 $9.96

26 12 | ea [Flexi-Set Uncuffed ET Tube w/Stylet, Plastic, 5.0mm $0.00 $1.39 $16.68 $3.32 $39.84
Guedel Airway, Individually Wrapped and Color Coded,

27 6 ea |Blue, 50mm $0.00 $0.41 $2.46 $0.40 $2.40
Guedel Airway, Individually Wrapped and Color Coded,

28 4 ea |Black, 60mm $0.00 $0.41 $1.64 $0.40 $1.60
Guedel Airway, Individually Wrapped and Color Coded,

29 5 ea |White, 70mm $0.00 $0.41 $2.05 $0.40 $2.00
Guedel Airway, Individually Wrapped and Color Coded,

30 6 ea |Green, 80mm $0.00 $0.62 $3.72 $0.40 $2.40
Guedel Airway, Individually Wrapped and Color Coded,

31 46 | ea|Red, 100mm $0.00 $0.61 $28.06 $0.41 $18.86
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Guedel Airway, Individually Wrapped and Color Coded,
32 42 | ea|Yellow, 90mm $0.00 $0.41 $17.22 $0.41 $17.22
4 ea King Airway Kit, LTS-D, Yellow, Double Lumen Tube,
33 Adult, Size 3 $0.00 $32.54 $130.16 $31.92 $127.68
25 ca King Airway Kit, LTS-D, Purple, Double Lumen Tube,
34 Adult Greater than 6 feet, Size 5 $0.00 $32.54 $813.50 $31.92 $798.00
10 ca King Airway Kit, LTS-D, Purple, Double Lumen Tube,
35 Adult Greater than 6 feet, Size 5 $0.00 $32.54 $325.40 $31.92 $319.20
15 ca King Vision Video Laryngoscope Blade, Channeled, Disp,
36 18mm, w/White $0.00 $31.25 $468.75 $27.45 $411.75
15 ca King Vision Video Laryngoscope Blade, Standard, Disp,
37 13mm, w/White LED, Digital CMOS Camera $0.00 $31.25 $468.75 $27.38 $410.70
5 ca Laryngoscope Handle, Standard, Satin Chrome-Plated Brass
38 Handle, AA Battery, Pediatric $0.00 $8.55 $17.10 $30.49 $60.98
5 ea Laryngoscope Handle, Standard, Satin Chrome-Plated Brass
39 Handle, C Battery, Adult $0.00 $8.55 $17.10 $34.83 $69.66
1 ca MacIntosh Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard,
40 Preemie, Size 0 $0.00 $3.92 $3.92 $6.35 $6.35
MacIntosh Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard,
41 112 |infant, size 1 $0.00 $8.01 $8.01 $6.35 $6.35
1 ca MacIntosh Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard,
42 Child, Size 2 $0.00 $8.01 $8.01 $6.35 $6.35
5 ca MacIntosh Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard,
43 MED Adult, Size 3 $0.00 $8.01 $16.02 $6.35 $12.70
5 ca MacIntosh Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard,
44 LG Adult, Size 4 $0.00 $8.01 $16.02 $6.35 $12.70
45 2 ea [Magill Catheter Forceps, Stainless Steel, Polished, Child $0.00 $3.37 $6.74 $2.95 $5.90
46 2 ea [Magill Catheter Forceps, Stainless Steel, Polished, Adult $0.00 $3.37 $6.74 $3.33 $6.66
47 8 ea [Mask for PortO2Vent CPAPos Oxygen Delivery System, LG $0.00 $14.03 $112.24 $13.81 $110.48
48 2 ea |Mask for PortO2Vent CPAPos Oxygen Delivery System, MED $0.00 $9.79 $19.58 $8.02 $16.04
49 5 ea |Mask for PortO2Vent CPAPos Oxygen Delivery System, SM $0.00 $10.95 $54.75 $9.93 $49.65
50 2 ea |Medical CPR Mask, 02 Inlet $0.00 $3.92 $7.84 $3.91 $7.82
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Miller Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard,

51 L 1@ preemie, size 0 $0.00 $8.01 $8.01 $6.35 $6.35
1 ca Miller Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard,
52 Infant, Size 1 $0.00 $8.01 $8.01 $6.35 $6.35
1 ca Miller Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard, Child,
53 Size 2 $0.00 $8.01 $8.01 $6.35 $6.35
5 ca Miller Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard, MED
54 Adult, Size 3 $0.00 $8.01 $16.02 $6.35 $12.70
Miller Laryngoscope Blade, Stainless Steel, Standard, LG
55 2 | 8 adult, size 4 $0.00 $8.01 $16.02 $6.35 $12.70
Misty Max 10 Nebulizer, 6inch Flextube, Mouthpiece,
56 | 30 |©@|gaffled Tee Adapter and 7 foot Tubing $0.00 $1.17 $35.10 $0.77 $23.10
57 10 ea |02 Connector, Nipple/Nut, Xmas Tree, Swivel, Green $0.00 $0.45 $4.50 $0.41 $4.10
970 | ea 02 Nasal Cannula, Adult, Clear Flared Nasal Prongs, 7
58 foot Kink Resistant Tube $0.00 $0.19 $184.30 $0.26 $252.20
59 2 ea |Ohmeda Male and Female Quick Connect, w/6inch Hose $0.00 $24.92 $49.84 $47.87 $95.74
60 5 ea |QuickTrach Cricothyrotomy Kit, 2mm, Child $0.00 $143.82 $719.10 $130.48 $652.40
61 8 ea [QuickTrach Cricothyrotomy Kit, 4mm, Adult $0.00 $143.82 $1,150.56 $119.21 $953.68
100 ca SPUR Il BVM, Adult, w/Bag Reservoir, Manometer,
62 Pressure Limiting Valve, MED Adult Mask $0.00 $9.26 $926.00 $8.72 $872.00
5 ea SPUR Il BVM, Infant, w/Bag Reservoir, Medication Port,
63 Manometer, Neonate Mask $0.00 $11.55 $57.75 $12.20 $61.00
6 ea SPUR Il BVM, Pediatric, w/Bag Reservoir, Manometer,
64 Infant Mask $0.00 $11.55 $69.30 $11.01 $66.06
65 4 ea |Tee Handle, for Inovo Regulators $0.00 $13.56 $54.24 $1.83 $7.32
66 60 ea [Thomas Endotracheal Tube Holder, Adult, Blue $0.00 $2.53 $151.80 $2.49 $149.40
5 ca Thomas Endotracheal Tube Holder, Pink Head Strap,
67 Pediatric $0.00 $2.50 $12.50 $2.49 $12.45
CATEGORY 1: Airway TOTALS NO BID $9,318.23 $8.739.89

CATEGORY 2: Diagnostic

NO BID
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68 25 |bx [Accu-Chek Safe-T-Pro Lancet, Single Use $0.00 $46.33 $1,158.25 $51.00 $1,275.00
Blood Pressure Unit, Nylon Adjustable Cuff, Metal Inflation
69 17 |ea |Valve, Black, Adult $0.00 $6.03 $102.51 $5.59 $95.03
Blood Pressure Unit, Nylon Adjustable Cuff, Metal Inflation
70 4 ea |Valve, Black, Child $0.00 $6.03 $24.12 $5.79 $23.16
Blood Pressure Unit, Nylon Adjustable Cuff, Metal Inflation
71 4 |ea |valve, Black, Infant $0.00 $6.03 $24.12 $5.79 $23.16
Blood Pressure Unit, Nylon Adjustable Cuff, Metal Inflation
72 10 |ea [Valve, Black, LG Adult $0.00 $6.77 $67.70 $5.79 $57.90
73 115 |bx |Breeze 2 Autodisc $0.00 $18.76 $2,157.40 $20.74 $2,385.10
74 5 |ea |Breeze 2 Blood Glucose Monitoring System $0.00 $22.06 $110.30 $0.00 $0.00
75 12 |ea [Breeze 2 Control Solution, Normal $0.00 $4.15 $49.80 $4.58 $54.96
76 8 ea |Disposable Penlight, 6/Pack $0.00 $0.77 $6.16 $0.55 $4.40
bx ECG Electrode, Perforated Clear Tape, Gel Pocket, Latex
" 235 Free, Pediatric/Neonatal, 3/pk for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $11.71 $2,751.85 $5.79 $1,360.65
78 5 |ea |Littmann Classic Il S.E. Stethoscope, 28inch, Burgundy Tube $0.00 $38.17 $190.85 $75.44 $377.20
Microstream FilterLine Set, CO2 Sampling Line,
79 | 115 [°? |Adult/Pediatric for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $8.65 $994.75 $10.66 | $1,225.90
Masimo SET LNCS Adtx Adhesive Sensor, Disposable, Adult,
80 90 ea |Greater than 30kg Lifepack 15 $0.00 $13.24 $1,191.60 $11.83 $1,064.70
Masimo SET LNCS DCI Sensor, Reusable, Adult Sp02,
81 12 ea |Greater than 30kg Lifepack 15 $0.00 $238.23 $2,858.76 $237.62 $2,851.44
Masimo SET LNCS Pdtx Adhesive Sensor, Disposable,
82 125 | ea |Pediatric SpO2, Between 10-50kg Lifepack 15 $0.00 $15.01 $1,876.25 $12.68 $1,585.00
Masimo SET LNCS Neo-L Adhesive Sensor, Disposable,
Neonatal Sp02, Less than 3kg or more than 40kg Lifepack
83 82 ealqc $0.00 $18.54 $1,520.28 $17.16 $1,407.12
Masimo SET LNCS DCIP Sensor, Reusable, Pediatric,
84 6 ea |Between 10-50kg Lifepack 15 $0.00 $236.58 $1,419.48 $244.15 $1,464.90
85 12 ea [Masimo SET LNCS Patient Cable, 4 foot Lifepack 15 $0.00 $162.13 $1,945.56 $158.00 $1,896.00
Masimo SET Rainbow Sensor, Reusable, 12 foot, Pediatric
86 2 ea |Lifepack 15 $0.00 $1,711.73 | $3,423.46 $860.49 $1,720.98
87 5 ea [Masimo SET Red LNCS Patient Cable, 4 foot Lifepack 15 $0.00 $162.13 $810.65 $167.32 $836.60
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Nellcor, SP02 Cable Extention, 9 PIN Connection, 4 foot

88 1 ea[(1.22mm) $0.00 $38.63 $38.63 $41.61 $41.61
Oxisensor Il Adhesive Pulse Oximeter Sensor, Disposable,

89 5 | ea|Between 3keand 20kg, Infant for Lifepack 12 $0.00 $16.57 $82.85 $17.91 $89.55
Oxisensor Il Adhesive Pulse Oximeter Sensor, Disposable,

90 o4 ea Between 10kg and 50kg, Pediatric for Lifepack 12 $0.00 $12.95 $310.80 $13.74 $329.76
Oxisensor Il Adhesive Pulse Oximeter Sensor, Disposable,

01 12 ea 18inch cable, Greater than 30kg, Adult for Lifepack 12 $0.00 $12.76 $153.12 $13.74 $164.88

92 85 ea |Physio Control Edge System Quik Combo Electrodes, Adult $0.00 $37.06 $3,150.10 $21.50 $1,827.50
Physio Control Edge System Quik Combo Electrodes,

93 25 ea |Pediatric $0.00 $39.71 $992.75 $24.70 $617.50

94 185 | ea |Physio-Control EKG Paper, 4.19inch x 73 foot $0.00 $3.46 $640.10 $3.05 $564.25
Smart CapnolLine CO2 Sampling Line, Disposable, Pediatric

95 60 | ea |for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $13.13 $787.80 $10.37 $622.20
Smart Capnoline Plus 02 Connector CO2 Sampling Line,

96 1065 | ea |Disposable, Adult/Intermediate for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $10.81 $11,512.65 $10.66 $11,352.90

97 4 ea |Standard Carrying Case, for the LifePak 15 $0.00 $228.31 $913.24 $235.61 $942.44

98 1 ea |SureTemp Plus 690 Thermometer $0.00 $222.07 $222.07 $240.10 $240.10
SureTemp Plus 690 Electronic Thermometer Disposable

99 70 bx |Probe Covers $0.00 $0.77 $53.90 $0.92 $64.58
SureTemp Plus 690 Electronic Thermometer w/Rectal

100 2 ea |Probe and Well Kit, 4 Foot Cord $0.00 $65.63 $131.26 $69.17 $138.34
ECG Electrode, Foam, w/Conductive Adhesive Gel, Adult,

101 925 | ea [30/pk for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $0.26 $240.50 $4.54 $4,199.50

102 4 ea [ThermoScan Pro 4000 Thermometer, Probe Covers, 200/BX $0.00 $0.07 $0.28 $12.60 $50.40
UltraCheck BP Cuff, Adult Single Tube, Reusable, 26-35cm,

103 10 | ea|ML Fitting for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $11.02 $110.20 $9.72 $97.20
UltraCheck BP Cuff, Child Single Tube, Reusable, 13-20cm,

104 4 ea |ML Fitting for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $7.98 $31.92 $7.04 $28.16

Page 6 of 16




City of Bryan - Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation for #13-043
Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals

Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All'bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not
be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract.

E-MED Medical Co.

EMS Supply &
Pharmaceuticals

Bound Tree Medical

UltraCheck BP Cuff, Infant Single Tube, Reusable, 08-14cm,

105 2 ea |ML Fitting for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $7.01 $14.02 $6.19 $12.38
UltraCheck BP Cuff, LG Adult Single Tube, Reusable, 32-
106 2 ea |42cm, ML Fitting for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $12.41 $24.82 $10.96 $21.92
UltraCheck BP Cuff, SM Adult Single Tube, Reusable, 18-
107 4 ea |26cm, ML Fitting for Lifepack 12 or 15 $0.00 $9.44 $37.76 $8.32 $33.28
CATEGORY 2: Diagnostic TOTALS NO BID $42,132.62 $41,147.65
CATEGORY 3: Drugs/Pharmaceuticals
108 25 ea |Acetaminophen, 160mg / 5ml, Cherry Elixer, 40z $1.15 $28.75 $1.08 $27.00 $1.51 $37.75
109 5 ea |Adenocard, 12mg, 4ml Ansyr Prefilled Syringe $24.60 $123.00 $75.38 $376.90 $23.89 $119.45
110 10 | ea|Adenocard, 6mg, 2ml Ansyr Prefilled Syringe $22.34 $223.40 $15.67 $156.70 $12.01 $120.10
111 5 ea |Albuterol, 2.5mg, 0.83mg/ml, 3ml Vials, 25/Box $4.39 $21.95 $4.62 $23.10 $3.82 $19.10
112 150 | ea|Amiodarone, 150mg, 3ml Vial $1.49 $223.50 $1.79 $268.50 $2.13 $319.50
113 20 btl |Aspirin, 81 mg Chewable Tablets, Orange Flavor 36/Bottle $0.89 $17.80 $0.69 $13.80 $0.67 $13.40
114 115 | ea |Atropine, 1mg, 10ml Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe $7.67 $882.05 $8.45 $971.75 $3.37 $387.55
115 5 ea |Calcium Chloride, 1gm, 10ml LifeShield Prefilled Syringe $12.32 $61.60 $3.27 $16.35 $4.15 $20.75
116 10 ea |Dextrose, 5%, 250ml Bag $1.41 $14.10 $0.93 $9.30 $0.92 $9.20
117 150 | ea |Dextrose, 50%, 25gm, 50ml Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe $8.00 $1,200.00 $5.69 $853.50 $5.34 $801.00
118 50 | ea [Diltiazem, 25mg, 5ml Vial (Refrigeration Required) $2.70 $135.00 $1.27 $63.50 $1.24 $62.00
119 65 ea |Diphenhydramine, 50mg/ml, 1ml Vial) $1.64 $106.60 $1.05 $68.25 $0.86 $55.90
120 25 ea |[Dopamine, 400mg, 10ml Vial $3.17 $79.25 $2.11 $52.75 $0.99 $24.75
121 65 ea |Epinephrine, 1:1,000, 1mg, 1ml, Ampule $1.42 $92.30 $1.09 $70.85 $1.08 $70.20
122 230 | ea Epinephrine, 1:10,000, 1mg, 10ml, Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe $4.31 $991.30 $2.33 $535.90 $2.52 $579.60
123 2 bx |C2 Fentanyl, 0.05mg/ml, 2 ml Vial, 25/Bx $33.38 $66.76 $20.68 $41.36 $23.56 $47.12
Fentanyl, Class Il, 0.05mg/ml, 2ml Carpuject (Requires
124 2 bx [Carpuject Holder #D250) $23.40 $46.80 $15.89 $31.78 $25.21 $50.42
Glucagen Diagnostic Kit, 1mg, 1ml, (1 Vial Powder, 1 Vial of
125 35 ea |Diluent) $129.59 $4,535.65 $121.32 $4,246.20 $151.98 $5,319.30
126 60 pk |Glutose, 3 Tube Pack, 15gm, Lemon $11.85 $711.00 $3.42 $205.20 $10.96 $657.60
127 5 ea |Heparin Sodium, 5000u/ml Carpuject, 1ml $8.22 $41.10 N/A $0.00 $4.58 $22.90
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Ipratropium Bromide / Albuterol, 0.5mg / 3.0mg,
128 380 | ea [Individually Wrapped, 30/Box $7.26 $2,758.80 $0.17 $64.60 $0.36 $136.80
129 3 bx [Ketamine, Class Ill, 50mg, 10ml Vial $29.73 $89.19 $43.41 $130.23 $44.52 $133.56
130 15 ea |Lactated Ringers, 1000m| Bag $1.49 $22.35 $0.97 $14.55 $1.10 $16.50
131 4 ea [Levophed, 0.1%, 4ml $4.00 $16.00 $9.26 $37.04 $10.55 $42.20
132 5 ea |Lidocaine 2gm / Dextrose 5%, 500ml Bag $5.72 $28.60 $5.12 $25.60 $5.10 $25.50
133 25 ea [Lidocaine, 2%, 100mg, 5ml Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe $3.11 $77.75 N/A $0.00 $2.51 $62.75
Lorazepam, Class IV, 2mg, 1ml Luer Locking Carpuject (Req.
134 3 bx [Carpuject Holder #D250), (Refrigerate $24.00 $72.00 $9.27 $27.81 $23.47 $70.41
135 15 ea |Magnesium Sulfate 50%, 5gm, 10ml Vial $1.77 $26.55 $1.39 $20.85 $1.51 $22.65
136 8 ea |Metoprolol, 5mg, 5ml Vial $1.02 $8.16 $0.93 $7.44 $2.02 $16.16
137 2 bx |Midazolam, Class IV, 10mg, 2ml Vial $36.42 $72.84 $35.76 $71.52 $28.30 $56.60
138 95 |ea [Naloxone, 2 mg, 2ml, Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe $16.44 $1,561.80 $7.73 $734.35 $15.13 $1,437.35
139 2 bx |Nitro-Bid Ointment, 2%, 1 gram Unit Dose, 48/Box $155.00 $310.00 $59.09 $118.18 $89.63 $179.26
140 | 12 | ea[Nitromist400mcg Spray, 8.5gm Bottle, 230 Metered Doses | ¢319 69 | $3836.28 | $235.87 | $2,830.44 | $196.78 | $2,361.36
Normal Saline, 10ml 0.9% Sodium Chloride in a 12ml
141 1700 | ea |Prefilled Syringe $0.44 $754.80 $0.39 $663.00 $0.37 $629.00
142 20 bx |Ondansetron, 4mg Dissolvable Tabs, 30 UD/Box $6.46 $129.20 $2.40 $48.00 $9.10 $182.00
143 195 | ea|Ondansetron, 4mg, 2ml Vial $3.00 $585.00 $0.50 $97.50 $1.12 $218.40
144 25 ea [Rocuronium, 10mg/ml, 10ml Vial $7.80 $195.00 $5.27 $131.75 $8.01 $200.25
S-2 Racemic Epinephrine Solution, 2.25%, 0.5ml Vial
145 5 ea |(Refrigeration Required) $1.30 $6.50 $2.16 $10.80 $1.41 $7.05
146 25 ea [Sodium Bicarbonate, 8.4%, 50ml Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe $7.20 $180.00 $6.25 $156.25 $5.34 $133.50
147 170 | ea[Sodium Chloride Irrigation, 0.9%, 500ml Pour Bottle $1.47 $249.90 $0.99 $168.30 $1.02 $173.40
148 2270 | ea |Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 1000ml Bag $1.56 $3,541.20 $1.78 $4,040.60 $0.97 $2,201.90
149 20 ea [Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 100ml Bag $1.33 $26.60 $1.76 $35.20 $1.17 $23.40
150 30 ea [Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 500ml Bag $1.39 $41.70 $0.92 $27.60 $0.78 $23.40
151 70 ea [Solu-Medrol, 125mg, 2ml Vial $2.98 $208.60 $5.37 $375.90 $5.36 $375.20
152 20 ea [Sterile Water, 10ml Vial $0.78 $15.60 $1.27 $25.40 $0.81 $16.20
153 15 ea [Tetracaine, 0.5%, gtts, 2ml Bottle $8.53 $127.95 $8.28 $124.20 $9.29 $139.35
154 85 ea [Thiamine, 200mg/ml, 2ml Vial $8.17 $694.45 $10.98 $933.30 $10.86 $923.10
155 8 ea |Vasopressin, 20 Units, 1ml Vial $10.99 $87.92 $3.42 $27.36 $2.31 18.48
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City of Bryan - Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation for #13-043
Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals

Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All'bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not
be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract.

E-MED Medical Co.

EMS Supply &
Pharmaceuticals

Bound Tree Medical

CATEGORY 3: Drugs/Pharmaceuticals TOTALS 25326.65 $18,980.46 $18,563.32
CATEGORY 4: Infection Control NO BID
Biohazard Waste Bag, 1.2 mil, Red w/Black Print, 23inch x

156 1 Cs |23inch, 7-10gal $0.00 $34.17 $34.17 $50.00 $50.00
Convenience Bag, White Opaque w/Hand Protector, Rigid

157 575 | ea[Collar, Inner Seal, 220z, 650cc $0.00 $1.17 $672.75 $0.83 $477.25

158 30 pr |FluidGard Boot Covers, Blue, XL $0.00 $0.52 $15.60 $1.65 $49.50

159 1 bx |Fluid-Resistant Face Mask w/Wraparound Visor $0.00 $22.06 $22.06 $13.31 $13.31
Impervious Personal Protection Gown, 15/bx, Blue,

160 2 bx |Universal Size $0.00 $8.46 $16.92 $9.45 $18.90
N95 1500 Series Respirator Mask, Disposable, Molded

161 20 ea [Nose Bridge, SM $0.00 $0.85 $17.00 $0.84 $16.88
N95 1500 Series Respirator Mask, Disposable, Molded

162 20 ea |Nose Bridge, MED $0.00 $0.85 $17.00 $0.84 $16.88
N95 1500 Series Respirator Mask, Disposable, Molded

163 25 ea |Nose Bridge, LG $0.00 $0.85 $21.25 $0.84 $21.10

164 115 | ea |Sleeve Gauntlet, 18inch, White, 200/cs $0.00 $0.42 $48.30 $0.27 $31.05
Supreno EC Gloves, Nitrile, Powder Free, Textured,

165 785 | ea |Extended Cuff, 11.6inch, LG $0.00 $6.63 $5,204.55 $6.22 $4,882.70
Supreno EC Gloves, Nitrile, Powder Free, Textured,

166 130 | ea |Extended Cuff, 11.6inch, MED $0.00 $6.63 $861.90 $6.22 $808.60
Supreno EC Gloves, Nitrile, Powder Free, Textured,

167 10 ea |Extended Cuff, 11.6inch, SM $0.00 $6.63 $66.30 $6.22 $62.20
Supreno EC Gloves, Nitrile, Powder Free, Textured,

168 685 | ea |[Extended Cuff, 11.6inch, XL $0.00 $6.63 $4,541.55 $6.22 $4,260.70
Transportable Sharps Container, Shuttle w/Locking

169 20 [ ea|Mechanism,11/2inchD x 6 1/2inch L $0.00 $1.55 $31.00 $1.54 $30.80

170 5 ea |Wall Safe Key, for Sharps Disposal Container $0.00 $17.92 $89.60 $1.12 $5.60
Wall Safe Sharps Container, Standard, 12inch H x 9 1/2inch

171 60 [ ea|w x4inch D, Beige, 5.4 Quart $0.00 $3.72 $223.20 $4.17 $250.20
CATEGORY 4: Infection Control TOTALS NO BID $11,883.15 $10,995.67
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City of Bryan - Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation for #13-043
Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals
Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All bids submitted a.re r_eﬂe_cted on this b_ld tab sheet. HOV\{ever, the Ilstl_ng of a bld. shou_ld not _ EMS Supply & _
be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will E-MED Medical Co. 2 Bound Tree Medical
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract. Pharmaceuticals
CATEGORY 5: IV & Syringes NO BID
172 20 ea |3-Way Stopcock w/ Swivel Male Luer Lock $0.00 $2.09 $41.80 $0.98 $19.60
Blood Admin Set, 10 Drop, Y-Type, 1 Injection Site, 170 $0.00
173 10 ea |Blood Filter, Pump Chamber, 85inch ’ $6.26 $62.60 $3.32 $33.20
Buretrol Solution Set, 60 Drop, w/150ml Interlink Burette, $0.00
174 6 ea |2 Interlink Inj Sites, 105inch ' $9.62 $57.72 $9.35 $56.10
Infu-Surg Disposable Pressure Infuser Bag, w/Bulb and $0.00
175 30 | ea|Gauge, Single Patient Use, 1000 mL ' $11.47 $344.10 $10.77 $323.10
176 430 | ea|Interlink Vial Access Cannula, 15ga $0.00 $0.29 $124.70 $0.33 $141.90
IV Admin Set, 10 Drop, Bravo24 Connector, Pre-Slit Port, 1 $0.00
177 2320 | ea |Removable Extension, 82inch ' $3.79 $8,792.80 $2.01 $4,663.20
IV Admin Set, 60 Drop, 1 Extension, Bravo24 Connector, $0.00
178 20 ea |Pre-Slit Port, Rotating Luer, 82inch ' $3.59 $71.80 $2.01 $40.20
179 5 ea IV Armboard, Disposable, Corrugated Core, 2inch x 6inch $0.00 $0.87 $4.35 $0.67 $3.35
180 10 ea IV Armboard, Disposable, Corrugated Core, 3inch x 9inch $0.00 $0.80 $8.00 $0.79 $7.90
IV Armboard, Disposable, Corrugated Core, 3inch x 18inch, $0.00
181 5 ea |100/cs ) $1.04 $5.20 $0.89 $4.45
IV Extension Set, Bravo24 Connector, Clamp, Rotating Luer, $0.00
182 1400 | ea|7inch ) $1.68 $2,352.00 $1.22 $1,708.00
IV Start Kit, incl Veni-Gard IV Dressing, Both Alcohol and $0.00
183 4000 | ea |Povidine Prep Pads, etc ) $1.00 $4,000.00 $0.68 $2,720.00
Jelco IV Catheters, ProtectlV Safety IV Radiopaque 14ga x $0.00
184 85 ea |2inch ) $1.66 $141.10 $1.57 $133.45
Jelco IV Catheters,ProtectlV Safety IV Radiopaque 16ga x 1 $0.00
185 155 | ea|1/4inch ) $1.66 $257.30 $1.57 $243.35
Jelco IV Catheters, ProtectlV Safety IV Radiopaque 18ga x 1 $0.00
186 1870 | ea|1/4inch ) $1.66 $3,104.20 $1.57 $2,935.90
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City of Bryan - Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation for #13-043
Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals
Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All bids submitted a.re r_eﬂe_cted on this b_ld tab sheet. HOV\{ever, the Ilstl_ng of a bld. shou_ld not _ EMS Supply & _
be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will E-MED Medical Co. 2 Bound Tree Medical
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract. Pharmaceuticals
Jelco IV Catheters, ProtectlV Safety IV Radiopaque 20ga x 1 $0.00
187 2690 | ea[1/4inch ) $1.66 $4,465.40 $1.57 $4,223.30
Jelco IV Catheters,ProtectlV Safety IV Radiopaque 22ga x $0.00
188 450 | ea|linch ) $1.66 $747.00 $1.57 $706.50
Jelco IV Catheters, ProtectlV Safety IV Radiopaque $0.00
189 35 ea |24ga x 3/4inch ) $1.66 $58.10 $1.57 $54.95
Kawasumi Intermittent Injection Site w/Male Luer $0.00
190 1 bx |Connector, 50/bx ’ $51.01 $51.01 $21.50 $21.50
191 65 ea |Mucosal Atomization Device w/3ml Syringe $0.00 $2.41 $156.65 $3.74 $243.10
Needle-Pro Needle w/Needle Protection Device, $0.00
192 3 bx [Hypodermic, Black, 22ga x 1 1/2inch ' $26.39 $79.17 $18.24 $54.72
Needle-Pro Needle w/Needle Protection Device, $0.00
193 3 bx [Hypodermic, Orange, 25ga x 5/8inch ' $26.39 $79.17 $18.24 $54.72
194 325 | ea |Syringe (Only), w/Cap, Luer Lock, 3cc $0.00 $0.04 $13.00 $0.05 $16.25
195 285 | ea [Syringe (Only), Luer Lock w/cap, 10-12cc $0.00 $0.08 $22.80 $0.12 $34.20
196 185 | bx [Tuberculin Syringe (Only), Luer Slip, 1cc $0.00 $6.24 $1,154.40 $7.00 $1,295.00
197 30 bx [Webcol Alcohol Preps, 2 ply, MED $0.00 $1.35 $40.50 $1.42 $42.60
CATEGORY 5: IV & Syringes TOTALS NO BID $26,234.87 $19,780.54
CATEGORY 6: Kits NO BID
198 20 ea |Asherman Chest Seal, Sterile, 5 1/2inch Diameter $0.00 $9.24 $184.80 $9.10 $182.00
Breathsaver Plus Bag, D Size, 27inch L x 13inch W x 12inch
199 2 ea |H, Red $0.00 $189.64 $379.28 $204.58 $409.16
200 5 ea |Foil Baby Bunting, Conserves Body Heat In Newborns $0.00 $3.10 $15.50 $3.08 $15.40
Intubation Case, 14-1/2inch x 8-1/2inch x 2inch, Black
201 2 ea w/Green Stripe $0.00 $105.56 $211.12 $54.88 $109.76
LA Rescue Cervical Collar Bag, Reflective Trim, 24inch L x
202 4 ea [1linch T x 5inch W $0.00 $27.45 $109.80 $14.90 $59.60
203 5 ea |Medicut Scalpel, Sterile, Disposable, Size 10 $0.00 $0.37 $1.85 $0.42 $2.10
204 12 ea |Obstetrical (OB) Kit, Sealed, Standard $0.00 $4.60 $55.20 $4.93 $59.16
205 5 bx SmartSafe Property Bags, 26inch x 27 1/2inch x 5inch, LG $0.00 $20.44 $102.20 $15.15 $75.75
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City of Bryan - Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation for #13-043
Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals

Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All'bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not
be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract.

E-MED Medical Co.

EMS Supply &
Pharmaceuticals

Bound Tree Medical

Ultra Breathsaver Bag, 27inch x 14inch x 12inch,

206 2 ea |Green $0.00 $268.77 $537.54 $289.94 $579.88
CATEGORY 6: Kits TOTALS NO BID $1,597.29 $1,492.81
CATEGORY 7: Linen/Paper NO BID

207 450 | ea |Curaplex Blanket, Polyester, Gray, 66in x 90in $0.00 $4.32 $1,944.00 $4.58 $2,061.00
Emergency Blanket, Disposable, Poly-Foam, 58inch x

208 12 ea |90inch $0.00 $3.70 $44.40 $2.87 $34.43
Pillow, Disposable, 90% Poly/10% Cotton, Light Weight,

209 235 | ea|16inch x 22inch $0.00 $2.55 $599.25 $2.49 $585.15

210 4 cs Pillowcase, Tissue/Poly, Disposable, 21inch x 30inch, White $0.00 $29.61 $118.44 $28.54 $114.16
Poly-Pro Flat Cot Sheet, 40inch x 84inch, Fluid-Resistant,

211 105 | cs |Disposable, Biodegradable, Dk Blue $0.00 $30.06 $3,156.30 $32.27 $3,388.35
SnugFit EMS Barrier Fitted Sheet, Blue, Non-woven/Poly,

212 100 | cs |[30inch X 84inch $0.00 $61.19 $6,119.00 $67.30 $6,730.00
Towels, Waffle-Embossed, Leakproof Poly-Backed, 3-Ply

213 3 Cs |Tissue, Disposable, 13inch x 8inch $0.00 $20.27 $60.81 $17.76 $53.28
CATEGORY 7: Linen/Paper TOTALS NO BID $12,042.20 $12,966.37
CATEGORY 8: Miscellaneous EMS

214 2 ea |EMS Field Guide ALS Version, 19th Edition $0.00 $18.16 $36.32 $18.08 $36.16
Kwikpoint English/Spanish Medical Visual Language

215 2 ea [Translator, Tear Resistant $0.00 $33.60 $67.20 $20.05 $40.10
Kwikpoint Medical Visual Language Translator,

216 2 ea |Laminated $0.00 $30.73 $61.46 $17.99 $35.98

217 2 ea |Onyx Nail Polish Remover for Finger Pulse Ox, Pads $0.00 $2.91 $5.82 $3.84 $7.68

218 2 ea |Ring Cutter $0.00 $3.59 $7.18 $4.79 $9.58
CATEGORY 8: Miscellaneous EMS TOTALS NO BID $177.98 $129.50
CATEGORY 9: Splints/Immobilizers NO BID
Buckle Set, for Kendrick Extrication Device (KED), 3 Black 2

219 1 st |White, Male $0.00 $14.62 $14.62 $15.06 $15.06
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City of Bryan - Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation for #13-043
Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals

Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All'bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not
be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract.

E-MED Medical Co.

EMS Supply &
Pharmaceuticals

Bound Tree Medical

EMS IMMOBILE-VAC Vacuum Mattress Set, Full Body, Case,

220 1 ea |Pump, Adapter, 2 Extra Sets of Handles $0.00 $219.52 $219.52 $342.39 $342.39

221 1 ea EMS IMMOBILE-VAC Vacuum Mattress, Reusable, Full Body $0.00 $325.94 $325.94 $251.65 $251.65
EMS IMMOBILE-VAC Mattress and Splints, Double Action,

222 1 ea [Vacuum Pump $0.00 $264.51 $264.51 $561.72 $561.72
Hand-E Hand Hold Device, Short Term, w/Retainer Strap,

223 10 ea |Yellow $0.00 $14.53 $145.30 $15.51 $155.10
Head Wedge Combination Pack incl 1 Head Wedge and 1

224 860 | ea |Adult Perfit Ace Adj Collar $0.00 $7.65 $6,579.00 $8.48 $7,292.80
Head Wedge Mini Combination Pack incl 1 Head Wedge

225 105 | ea|and 1 Mini Perfit Ace Adj Collar $0.00 $7.65 $803.25 $8.48 $890.40

226 1 ea |Jerome Add-a-Splint Extremity Splint, Complete Kit $0.00 $231.63 $231.63 $108.67 $108.67

227 4 ea |Jerome Add-a-Splint Extremity Splint, Wrist/Forearm $0.00 $33.30 $133.20 $11.39 $45.56

228 4 ea |Jerome Add-a-Splint Extremity Splint, Half Arm $0.00 $28.17 $112.68 $13.13 $52.52

229 5 ea |Jlerome Add-a-Splint Extremity Splint, Full Arm $0.00 $48.47 $242.35 $17.52 $87.60
Jerome Add-a-Splint Extremity Splint, Sling/Shoulder

230 4 ea [Harness $0.00 $44.88 $179.52 $14.89 $59.56

231 5 ea |Jlerome Add-a-Splint Extremity Splint, Ankle/Elbow $0.00 $52.26 $261.30 $17.52 $87.60

232 4 ea |Jerome Add-a-Splint Extremity Splint, Full Leg $0.00 $64.56 $258.24 $21.04 $84.16

233 1 ea |Kendrick Vest, Green $0.00 $64.30 $64.30 $104.65 $104.65

234 8 pr |KED Head/Chin Strap Disposable $0.00 $28.67 $229.36 $4.27 $34.16
Limb Restraints, Adult Wrist/Ankle, 2 D-rings, Adjustable,

235 65 pr |Disposable, Poly, White $0.00 $2.95 $191.75 $2.90 $188.50
Replacement Band For the Hand-E Hand Hold Device

236 2 ea $0.00 $2.62 $5.24 $2.90 $5.80
Sager S-304 Splint, Total Concept Super, Adult/Child ( 6 yrs

237 1 ea |& up), w/Soft Case, Bilateral $0.00 $292.28 $292.28 $327.41 $327.41

238 30 ea [SAM Splint, Standard, 36inch, Roll, Orange/Blue $0.00 $6.35 $190.50 $4.63 $138.90
STRAP 2 PC 7 FT SEAT BELT BUCKLE LOOP LOCK ORANGE

239 5 ea [IMPERVIOUS $0.00 $8.93 $44.65 $7.02 $35.10

Page 13 of 16




City of Bryan - Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation for #13-043

Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals

Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All bids submitted a.re r_eﬂe_cted on this b_ld tab sheet. HOV\{ever, the Ilstl_ng of a bld. shou_ld not _ EMS Supply & _
be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will E-MED Medical Co. 2 Bound Tree Medical
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract. Pharmaceuticals
Straps, Bioplastic, Side Release Buckle, 2 Piece w/Speedclip,
240 125 | ea|Yellow, 5 feet $0.00 $6.88 $860.00 $13.10 $1,637.50
CATEGORY 9: Splints/Immobilizers TOTALS NO BID $11,649.14 $12,506.81
CATEGORY 10: Suction NO BID
241 2 ea [120V AC Fixed Volt Charger, for S-SCORT Il and S-SCORT 9 $0.00 $76.43 $152.86 $72.98 $145.96
242| 10 ea |Gastric Sump Tube, 36inch L, 10 French $0.00 $1.93 $19.30 $1.73 $17.30
243| 10 ea |Gastric Sump Tube, 48inch L, 12 French $0.00 $1.93 $19.30 $1.73 $17.30
244| 15 ea |Gastric Sump Tube, 48inch L, 14 French $0.00 $1.93 $28.95 $1.73 $25.95
245| 15 ea |Gastric Sump Tube, 48inch L, 16 French $0.00 $1.93 $28.95 $1.73 $25.95
246| 10 ea |Gastric Sump Tube, 48inch L, 18 French $0.00 $1.93 $19.30 $1.73 $17.30
Hi-Flow Suction Canister, Rigid, Disp, Green Top, Aerostat
247 70 ea |Filter, 1200ml $0.00 $3.05 $213.50 $3.04 $212.80
Meconium, Suction Unit, Aspirator, Single Hand, Thumb
248 5 ea |Port $0.00 $3.87 $19.35 $4.13 $20.65
249 1 ea [S-SCORT llI Suction Unit, with Vinyl Case, Red $0.00 $651.84 $651.84 $455.79 $455.79
Suction Canister, Rigid, Disp, Red Top, Hydrophobic Shut-
250 10 ea |off Filter, 800ml $0.00 $0.22 $2.20 $0.20 $2.00
Suction Canister, Rigid, Disp, Red Top, Hydrophobic Shut-
251 20 ea |off Filter, 800ml $0.00 $1.94 $38.80 $2.31 $46.20
252| 15 ea |Terumo Syringe w/o Needle, 20z Catheter Tip, 60cc $0.00 $0.36 $5.40 $0.46 $6.90
253| 120 | ea|Yyankauer Suction Handle, Tip and Tube, Vented $0.00 $1.41 $169.20 $0.40 $48.00
CATEGORY 10: Suctions TOTALS NO BID $1,368.95 $1,042.10
CATEGORY 11: Wound Care NO BID
254 2 bx [Adaptic Non-Adhering Dressing, 3inch x 3inch, 50/bx $0.00 $17.42 $34.84 $31.82 $63.64
Adhesive Bandage, White Cross, Flexible Cloth, linch x
255 5 bx |3inch $0.00 $0.92 $4.60 $2.20 $11.00
256 5 bx |Ammonia Inhalants Ampules, 10/bx $0.00 $1.40 $7.00 $2.98 $14.90
257| 40 | ea|Bloodstopper Trauma Dressing $0.00 $2.26 $90.40 $2.24 $89.60
Burn Sheet, Sterile, Non-Woven, Made of Tissue Fiber,
258| 10 ea |60inch x 90inch $0.00 $1.67 $16.70 $2.66 $26.60
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E-MED Medical Co.

EMS Supply &
Pharmaceuticals

Bound Tree Medical

Cloth Adhesive Surgical Tape, Hypoallergenic, linch x 10

259| 10 bx |yard $0.00 $6.90 $69.00 $8.04 $80.40
Cloth Adhesive Surgical Tape, Hypoallergenic, 2inch x 10
260 18 bx |yard $0.00 $6.90 $124.20 $8.04 $144.72
Cloth Adhesive Surgical Tape, Hypoallergenic, 3inch x 10
261 15 bx |yard $0.00 $6.90 $103.50 $8.12 $121.80
Coban Self-Adherent Wrap, Tan, 2inch x 5 yard (Fully
262| 120 |roll|Stretched) $0.00 $0.28 $33.60 $1.53 $183.60
263 4 cs Cold Pack, Instant, Single Use, Junior, 4 1/2inch x 7inch $0.00 $12.59 $50.36 $13.46 $53.84
264 1 bx |Eye Pads, Oval, Sterile, 1 5/8inch x 2 5/8inch $0.00 $4.53 $4.53 $3.70 $3.70
Gallant Preparation Razors, Contoured Handle, Platium
265 100 [ea |coated Stainless Steel Blade $0.00 $0.34 $34.00 $0.33 $33.00
Gauze Sponge, 100% Woven Cotton, Sterile, 4inch x 4inch,
266| 743 |tray|12 Ply $0.00 $0.07 $52.01 $2.58 $1,916.94
267 1 cs |Hot Packs, 6inch x 8 1/4inch $0.00 $6.35 $6.35 $6.49 $6.49
268| 80 [ea |Hydrogen Peroxide, 80z Plastic Bottle $0.00 $10.30 $824.00 $0.98 $78.40
269| 55 ea |lsopropyl Alcohol, 70%, 160z $0.00 $1.21 $66.55 $1.68 $92.40
270| 135 | ea|MediChoice Lubricating Jelly, Sterile, 5gm Packet $0.00 $0.05 $6.75 $0.10 $13.50
271 5 ea [Morgan Lens Eye Therapeutic, Disposable $0.00 $4.97 $24.85 $21.31 $106.55
Povidone lodine (PVP) Swabsticks, Saturated with 10% PVP
272 2 ea [Solution 1/pk $0.00 $1.55 $3.10 $4.88 $9.76
273 20 ea |Pro-Series Utility/EMS Shears, 7 14inch, Black $0.00 $0.87 $17.40 $0.75 $15.00
Transpore Surgical Tape, Clear, Porous, Hypoallergenic,
274 7 bx |1inch x 10 yard $0.00 $12.80 $89.60 $12.86 $90.02
275| 35 ea |[Trauma Dressing, Sterile, 12inch x 30inch $0.00 $0.87 $30.45 $0.71 $24.85
267| 80 | ea|Triangular Bandages, 36inch x 36inch x 51linch $0.00 $0.24 $19.20 $0.24 $19.20
277| 260 | ea|Woven Gauze Roll, 4.5inch x 4.1 yard, 6-Ply, Sterile $0.00 $1.22 $317.20 $0.55 $143.00
CATEGORY 11: Wound Care TOTALS NO BID $2,030.19 $3,342.91
Vendor |Official Vendor Official Vendor
Total Total Total Total Total Official Total
Category 1: Airway Total $0.00 $0.00|] $9,318.23| $9,318.23| $8,739.89 $8,739.89
Category 2: Diagnostic Total $25,326.65| $25,326.65| $42,132.62 $42,132.62| $37,288.30( $41,147.65
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Bid Tabulation for #13-043
Annual Price Agreement Emergency Medical Supplies and Pharmaceuticals
Open Date: June 6, 2013 @ 2:00 p.m.

All'bids submitted are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid should not
be construed as any indication that the City accepts such bid as responsive. The City will
notify the successful bidder upon award of contract.

E-MED Medical Co.

EMS Supply &
Pharmaceuticals

Bound Tree Medical

Category 3: Drugs/Pharmaceutical Total $0.00 $0.00| $19,171.21| $18,980.46] $18,563.32[ $18,563.32
Category 4: Infection Control Total $0.00 $0.00{ $11,883.15| $11,883.15| $10,995.67( $10,995.67
Category 5: IV & Syringes total $0.00 $0.00| $26,234.87| $26,234.87] $19,780.54| $19,780.54
Category 6: Kits Total $0.00 $0.00] $1,597.29 $1,597.29 $1,492.81 $1,492.81
Category 7: Linen/Pater Total $0.00 $0.00{ $12,042.20[ $12,042.20| $12,966.37 $12,966.37
Category 8: Miscellaneous Total $0.00 $0.00 $177.98 $177.98 $129.50 $129.50
Category 9: Splints/Immobilizers Total $0.00 $0.00{ $11,649.14 $11,649.14| $12,506.81 $12,506.81
Category 10: Susction Total $0.00 $0.00f $1,368.95| $1,368.95] $1,042.10 $1,042.10
Category 11: Wound Care Total $0.00 $0.00f $2,030.19] $2,030.19] $3,342.91 $3,342.91

Categories Total| $25,326.65| $25,326.65|$132,308.54| $137,415.08| $126,848.22 $130,707.57

NO BIDS FROM: Midwest Medical Supply

ZOLL Medical Corporation

Green BoundTree: Item 74 No charge with purchase of strips

Orange Amounts on vendor bid differs from official total

Bids Opened By: Susan Chmelar

Recorded By: Hathy Yeager
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